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FOREWORD 
 
 
There is no cooking without salt. Tax today is pretty much like 
salt, it finds its way into many areas of our modern life. “Give 
to Caesar that which belongs to Caesar.” Our Lord’s answer to 
the evangelical sticky tax question confronts us with our 
mutual inclusive moral and legal obligations on the subject. 
Hence the obvious implications that taxation brings in the 
spheres of morality and legality. ”No taxation without 
representation1” sets out our constitutional and democratic right 
to stand up and be counted, Thus the obvious manifestation of 
tax in the field of political science. Tax is a contribution levied 
on persons, property and business, used for the support of the 
state.  It is painfully accepted as part of our existence and our 
social obligations towards our fellow countrymen. None the 
less, whether one needs to do this by application of 
proportional, aggressive or regressive taxation, remains a 
question that clearly manifests itself when tax becomes a 
punching bag on a rightist and leftist political divide. From all 
this there emerges the omnipresence of taxation in the field of 
political ideology and social welfare. Taxation in the modern 
state is not only a means to an end - that of collecting taxation - 
but it is also a macro economic tool used by economists and 
politicians alike, to steer the state into a planned direction .  
 
These are but a few simple quotations and ideas which directly 
underpin the impact that taxation has on socio-political, 
economic, moral and legal studies and which, indirectly, show 
the intricacies and complexities of modern income tax law and 
practice. It is exactly these last two considerations, which this 
book addresses. The intricacy and complexity of income tax 
require a text book with the specific objective of shedding light 
into a long , dark tunnel of rules and regulations which each 
citizen of this State has a legal obligation to be aware of.  Even 
more onerous than simple awareness is the fact that each citizen 
is deemed to understand all the implications of the Income Tax 
laws in his relations with the State. 
 

                                                
1 Reverend Jonathan Mayhew in a sermon in Boston in 1750 
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Since the enactment of the Income Tax Act in 1948 there have 
been only a few attempts to fill the tax-complexity divide 
through literature. In 1989 the Inland Revenue, in collaboration 
with the Malta Institute of Taxation printed Volume 1 of the 
Income Tax cases, “Decisions of the Court of Appeal2”. In 2005 a 
friend and a fellow member of the Institute, Dr Robert Attard 
published “An Introduction to Income Tax Theory”. During 
2007, the Inland Revenue, again in collaboration with our 
Institute, published Volume 1 of the income tax cases, 
“Decisions of the Board of Special Commissioners3”.  
Encouraged by the well deserved public response to his first 
book; in Dr Robert Attard, in 2008, published his second book 
“Principles of Maltese Tax Law”. Before 1998 the only other 
book that had been published, but which has long been out of 
print was, “Notes on Income Tax in Malta” written and 
published by my learned friend and colleague Edwin A. Vella. 
In between Mr Vella’s pioneering work, and Dr Attard’s tax-
literary kick start, there was a complete void, although it must 
be mentioned that in 1979 the Inland Revenue did print, if only 
for internal use, a “Tax Handbook for Assessors”.  During this 
period, the Inland Revenue, in collaboration with the Malta 
Institute of Accountants also printed Volume 1 in three parts of 
“Decizjonijiet tal-Bord ta’ Kummissarji Speciali”.  
 
Now, in 2009, the Malta Institute of Taxation is pleased to 
publish this book. It is not my intention to compare and 
contrast the merits or demerits of this or any other particular 
tax publication, however, I believe I must emphasise that this 
book has its uniqueness as all the other publications have. In 
the first place, this book has been prepared by eleven authors 
and reviewed by an almost equal number of reviewers, all of 
them tax practitioners and members of the Malta Institute of 
Taxation. This is a first for tax literature in Malta. Naturally, it 
stand to reason that the contribution of so many individuals 
makes this book non-homogeneous in terms of style and 
diction, but on the other hand, this fact should contribute to the 
delivery of  better prepared technical material since most of the 
authors concentrated their efforts on their field of specialisation 
in fiscal matters. A welcome feature of this book is that it comes 
with up-dates for the next two years and thus the overall 

                                                
2 Volumes 2,3,4 and 5 have been published in 2002, 2003, 2004 and 2006 
respectively. 
3 Volume 2 published in 2008. 



 6 

package ensures that the user is kept up-to-date for at least 
three years. After this period the Institute intends to turn this 
work into an e-book which readers and users will be able to 
access over the Internet. 
 
Users of this Manual whether you are a student, studying tax 
law or a taxpayer seeking to enlighten your self on a particular 
tax problem, or anybody else, please bear in mind that this 
book is intended for guidance only and as such neither the 
Malta Institute of Taxation nor the authors, reviewers, 
coordinators and the General Editor will accept any liability 
arising from any use or miss-use of this work.  If in doubt, you 
should always seek professional advice.  
 
My sincere thanks and gratitude go to everyone who 
contributed towards the making of this book - the Authors, the 
Reviewers, the Co Ordinators,.the Insitute’s Council members 
and secretarial staff. 
 
 
 
Dr Renald Micallef LL.D., FMIT, FCCA, FIA, MISP, CPA 
President of the Malta Institute of Taxation      
General Editor 
 
Attard 25th November 2009 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 7 

 
 

THE  AUTHORS 
 

Dr. Robert Attard LL.D. Director Tax Services, Ernst  & 
Young: Robert Attard is the author of several works on 
taxation.  His books have been cited and referred to by the 
Board of Special Commissioners and the Court of Appeal. 
Robert is Director of Tax Services at Ernst Young  and an 
Editorial Board Member Lexis-Nexis Butterworths (EU Tax 
Tracker Project). Robert lectures at the University of Malta and 
has paid lecturing/speaking visits at Queen Mary (University 
of London), CTL (University of Cambridge), 
Salerno/Vienna/Naples II and the University of Palermo (Phd 
Program of Human Rights jointly held with the Brussels 
Academy of Legal Theory). He has provided editorial 
consultancy to the British tax Review. As a lawyer in private 
practice Robert has argued cases at all levels including 
landmark cases. Robert has made contributions to Maltese 
culture and his biography was featured in Dictionary of Maltese 
Biographies (2009). 
 
Dr. Juanita Brockdorff B.A., LL.D., LL.M. (Leiden) Associate 
Director, Tax Services KPMG : At KPMG Malta Juanita leads a 
multi-disciplinary team of lawyers and accountants providing 
advice to multinationals seeking assistance in tax matters and 
related planning.  Since 2002, when she joined the firm, Juanita 
has dealt with both domestic and international tax issues, with 
her advice covering both direct and indirect taxation.  She is 
particularly interest in the EU’s impact on taxation, and acts as 
advisor to the Government on various tax-related Community 
law issues.  Juanita’s work has been published in international 
tax reviews such as European Taxation, EC Tax Review, 
Intertax and Captive and Art Review.  She regularly delivers 
presentations on taxation, locally and overseas, and for a 
number of years she lectured on Advanced Taxation for the 
ACCA.  She has also taught modules in the course leading to 
the Advanced Diploma in International Taxation conferred by 
the UK Chartered Institute of Taxation.  She appears in the 
section identifying Notable Practitioners in Tax in the 2009 
edition of Chambers and Partners, Europe’s Leading Lawyers 
for Business as “earning praise for her rising profile”. 
 



 8 

Mr. Walter Cutajar B.A. (Hons) Accty., F.I.A., A.M.I.T., A.F.A. 
Managing Director, Avanzia Tax Advisors Limtied Member 
firm of Taxand:  Walter is the managing director at Avanzia 
Taxand Limited, Malta’s leading independent firm of tax 
advisors.  With over 18 years of experience in local and 
International tax, Walter enjoys a reputation of adopting a 
commercial approach to his advice.  Walter advises a number of 
multi-national companies and also sits on the board of directors 
of several companies. He specializes in international tax matters 
with particular reference to holding companies, treasury and 
finance operations and IP companies.  During his time as a Big 
4 partner Walter was responsible for the firm’s tax department 
and a regular participant in international tax conferences, 
seminars and other events.  He continues to give various 
lectures and presentations and is the author of various taxation 
articles. Walter holds a first degree in Accounting and a post 
graduate in International Tax Law.  He is a fellow member of 
the Malta Institute of Taxation, a member of the Institute of 
Financial Services Practitioners, a member of the International 
Fiscal Association and sits on various councils and committees 
in the fields of taxation and financial services.   
 
Mr.  Nikki Dimech CPA, ACCA, MIA, AMIT (registered 
auditor), Managing Partner – Nikki Dimech & Co.:  Member 
of the Malta Institute of Accountants, and of the Association of 
Chartered Certified Accountants, and of the Malta Institute of 
Taxation, Nikki holds the warrants of Certified Public 
Accountant and registered Auditor. He has the Advanced 
Diploma in International Taxation Chartered Institute of 
Taxation, London,  Awarded Gold Medal for attaining highest 
marks in Principles of International Taxation.Current Chairman 
of the Education Committee of the Malta Institute of Taxation, 
Nikki lectures ACCA, MIT and ADIT students and frequently 
delivers lectures and seminars to fellow professional 
accountants, auditors and lawyers in relation to taxation 
legislation. Elected Mayor of Sliema Local Council in June 2009.  
Managing and founding partner of Nikki Dimech & Co, a 
medium sized audit firm with around 12 staff members.  Such 
firm provided audit, tax and assurance services.  50% 
shareholder in Dimech, Vella & Co. Ltd, a company offering 
accountancy, management, company formation and statutory 
services. 
 



 9 

Mr. David Ferry B.A. (Hons) Accountancy, M.A. (Financial 
Services), F.I.A., F.M.I.T. Senior Manager – Tax and Legal 
Services, PricewaterhouseCoopers:  David Ferry is a partner in 
the Tax and Legal Services Unit of PricewaterhouseCoopers in 
Malta.  He joined PricewaterhouseCoopers (then Coopers & 
Lybrand) in 1994 in the Tax and Legal Services Unit of the firm 
after having graduated in accountancy from the University of 
Malta, He also holds a M.A. Financial Services. David has 
extensive experience in corporate taxation as well as VAT and 
other indirect taxation matters.  He has specialized in VAT 
matters since 1997 and has participated in a number of 
seminars, presentations and conferences on this subject.  He 
also assisted various clients in VAT tribunal case.  David is 
chairman of the Tax Committee of the Malta Institute of 
Accountants.  He is also a member of the Malta Institute of 
Taxation.  David is the partner primarily responsible for VAT 
related matters in the Malta practice of 
PricewaterhouseCoopers. 
 
Dr. Antoine Fiott LL.D., Advocate Partner in the law firm 
Fiott Advocates, Lecturer in taxation at the University of 
Malta and at the Malta Institute of Taxation:  Antoine Fiott is a 
partner in the law firm Fenech Farrugia Fiott Legal and he 
specializes in tax law. He has served in the Inland Revenue 
Department, the Office of the Attorney General and with 
PricewaterhouseCoopers.  He is a lecturer in taxation in the 
University of Malta and in the Malta Institute of Taxation,  He 
is a Fellow and a former president of the Malta Institute of 
Taxation. 
 
Mr. Marvin Gaerty ACCA, CPA, A.M.I.T., A.M.I.A. Head Tax 
Compliance Unit: Marvin Gaerty is a member of the 
Association of Chartered Certified Accountants, and he is 
managing the Tax Compliance Unit, having previously worked 
as a tax advisor, stockbroker and compliance officer with a 
company providing investment services.  Marvin is also a 
lecturer for the Advanced ACCA tax paper with BPP 
Professional Education Malta, and the Diploma in Taxation 
with the Malta Institute of Taxation. 
 
Dr. Neville Gatt LL.D., LL.M. (Lond):  Neville Gatt is Partner 
and Director of Tax Services at PricewaterhouseCoopers.  He 
graduated in law from the University of Malta in 1993 and 
joined the firm in 1994 after specializing in international and EC 



 10 

taxation at the University of London.  Was seconded to the 
International Tax Services Group within the London office in 
1998.  Lecturer and examiner at the University of Malta and has 
also lectured at the Malta   Institute of Accountants, the Malta 
Institute of Taxation and the Chartered Institute of Bankers. 
 
Dr. Stefan Patrick Gauci B.A., LL.M., (IMLI) LL.D. Dip. Tax 
Corporate, Trusts, Maritime Transport and Tax Advisor, 
Advocates CREDAL:  Stefan Patrick Gauci is a partner of 
Advocates CREDAL. Stefan’s fields of expertise include 
corporate law and multi-jurisdictional corporate structures, 
contract and employment law, trust law, international  
transport law, and international tax planning.  Stefan has  
addressed seminars organized by the Malta Institute of 
Taxation and contributed articles to “Law and Practice”, a 
publication of the Malta Chamber of Advocates.   
 
Mr. Mark Grech B.A. (Hons) Business Management, F.I.A., 
M.M.I.T. Partner, Deloitte:  Mr. Mark Grech graduated in 
Business Management from the University of Malta in 1986 and 
became a qualified accountant in 1991.  He joined the Public 
Service in 1986 and in 1993 was appointed Deputy Head of the 
International Tax Unit within the Inland Revenue Department.  
This Unit is responsible for all taxation matters relating to 
international business activities and the financial services 
sector.  In October 2000   Mark joined Deloitte as Tax Director 
and became a partner in 2004, assuming overall responsibility 
for the firm’s direct and indirect tax practice. 
 
Dr. Robert Taylor East B.A. LL.M., (Lond.) LL.D.:  Dr. Robert 
Taylor East graduated Doctor of Laws in 2002 and was 
subsequently awarded a master of Laws degree in Tax and 
Corporate Law from Queen Mary, University of London.  
Robert was admitted to the Bar in Malta in 2004 and is a Senior 
Associate with Giglio Spiteri Bailey Advocates.  His principal 
practice areas comprise International Taxation, Corporate Law 
and Trusts and Estate Planning. 
 
Mr. Edwin Vella D.P.A., F.M.I.T., ACI Arb, Tax Consultant, 
Life President, Malat Institute of Taxation:  Mr. Edwin Vella, 
is a  former head of the Inland Revenue Department. Later 
consultant to PriceWaterhouse.  Lecturer and examiner in 
taxation for several years at the University of Malta and the 
Malta Institute of Accountants.  Author of text books and 



 11 

numerous articles on taxation. He also lectures regularly on the 
subject. Bank Director and adviser to Government.  Has been 
member of several high powered Government committees.  
Registered Arbitrator.  Founder member and first President of 
the Malta Institute of Taxation.  Now Life President of the 
Institute. 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 

 


